



Kelly Tractor Co.
 Serving the Industry Since 1933
 kccat@kellytractor.com
 www.kellytractor.com

July 23, 2014



Sun 'n Lake of Sebring
 Improvement District
 ATTN: Greg Griffin
 (863) 382-2196

**REF: Quoted as per Florida Sheriff's Association Contract #13-11-0904
 Specification#20**

DIAMOND ROTARY MOWER OPTIONS

Qty	Order Code	Description	
1	DBM-C-M	19' Side Fold Boom	\$ 24,045
1	102	Transport Lock	\$ 429
1	DBR050-H	50" Rotary Head	\$ 10,874
1	160	Factory Mount – Side Fold Boom Mowers	\$ 4,657
LIST PRICE TOTAL			\$ 40,005
LESS 10% CONTRACT DISCOUNT			\$ -4,001
CONTRACT PRICE			\$ 36,004
LESS ADDITIONAL DISCOUNT			\$ -1,004
QUOTE PRICE GRANDTOTAL			\$ 35,000

Note: Side fold and rear cradle booms include boom, mounting hardware, 4-spool valve, cable controls, Lexan safety glass & wheel weights.

Quote includes pick-up and delivery. Estimated delivery 10-12 weeks.

Tractor Info: Case IH Farmall 95
 4WD
 14.9 x 28 Front Tire Size (max)
 18.4 x 38 Rear Tire Size (max)
 Cab

Thank you for consideration of our product. Quote is valid for sixty days.
 Greg Bennett 305-592-5374 ext 1121
 Governmental Sales Cell 786-229-7037 Fax 305-477-2024



**FLORIDA SHERIFFS ASSOCIATION
& FLORIDA ASSOCIATION OF COUNTIES**

**AGRICULTURE TYPE TRACTOR WITH BOOM MOWER (4 WHEEL DRIVE)
SPECIFICATION #20**

2014 Massey Ferguson 5613 with Diamond Boom Mower

The Massey Ferguson 5613 with Diamond Boom Mower purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for this model and FSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base price as awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE:	Western	Northern	Central	Southern
BASE PRICE:	-- No bid --	-- No bid --	\$118,756.00	\$118,756.00

While the Florida Sheriffs Association and Florida Association of Counties have attempted to identify and include those equipment items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.

VEHICLE:	5613 with Diamond Boom Mower			
DEALER:			Kelly Tractor Co.	Kelly Tractor Co.
ZONE:	Western	Northern	Central	Southern
BASE PRICE:	-- No bid --	-- No bid --	\$118,756.00	\$118,756.00

Order Code	Delete Options	Western & Northern	Central & Southern
MF4608 ²	Downgrade model - specify MF4608 4WD CAB/AC TRACTOR ONLY @ \$39,567 ²		(\$79,219.00) ²
	Downgrade model - specify		
7292177 ²	Downgrade to 2 wheel drive		(\$5,948.00) ²
20' BOOM ²	Downgrade to a 20' boom reach DBM-C-P 20' REAR CRADLE BOOM, DBR-060-H 60" ROTARY HEAD ²		(\$9,211.00) ²
LESS OFF BOOM ²	Downgrade - specify MF5613 4WD 100PTO CAB/AC TRACTOR ²		(\$48,097.00) ²
	Downgrade - specify		
	Optional equipment delete - specify		
	Optional equipment delete - specify		
	Optional equipment delete - specify		

Order Code	Add Options	Western & Northern	Central & Southern
MF6615 ²	Model upgrade - specify MF6615 4WD 110PTO CAB/AC TRACTOR ONLY @ \$85,866 ²		(\$32,920.00) ²
	Model upgrade - specify		
	Model upgrade - specify		
	Enclosed cab with heating and air conditioning		Std
7292027 ²	Air suspension seat cab only		\$846.00 ²
7294248 ²	AM/FM stereo with cassette and quartz clock		\$575.00 ²
7292029 ²	Rear washer/wiper, rotating beacon REAR WASHER/WIPER ONLY ²		\$390.00 ²
	4-wheel drive		Std
	Oscillating hydraulic assist front axle		
	CVT transmission with constant velocity		NA
7292194 ²	3 spool valve and selector		\$986.00 ²
	Additional fuel tank		NA
	Telescopic mirrors		Std
75-W1511 ²	Treleborg 22 ply tires or equivalent NOKIAN INDUSTRIAL ²		\$8,978.00 ²
	High capacity air cleaner		Std

VEHICLE: 5613 with Diamond Boom Mower
DEALER: Kelly Tractor Co. Kelly Tractor Co.
ZONE: Western Northern Central Southern
BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- \$118,756.00 \$118,756.00

25' BOOM W5' ROTARY ²	25' boom mower with rotary 5' cutting head DBM-C-G 25' HD BOOM, DBR060-H ROTARY HEAD, 116 LG HYD ACTUATOR -NOT INSTALLED @ \$47,739 ²			2
25' BOOM W5' FLAIL ²	25' boom mower with rotary 5' flail cutting head DBM-C-G 25' HD BOOM, DBF063-H FLAIL HEAD, 116 LG HYD ACTUATOR -NOT INSTALLED @ \$49,036 ²			2
7293328 ²	Additional required wheel weights for boom mower		\$551.00 ²	
	Headmount, 15 degree offset			
	Electronic 3 point hitch control			Std
101 ²	Optional equipment - specify JOYSTICK 4 FUNCTION, PROPORTIONAL ²		\$5,947.00 ²	
107 ²	Optional equipment - specify JOYSTICK 5 FUNCTION, PROPORTIONAL ²		\$7,525.00 ²	
119 ²	Optional equipment - specify JOYSTICK 4 FUNCTION, SOFT SHIFT ²		\$2,290.00 ²	
102 ²	Optional equipment - specify MOWER TRANSPORT LOCK ²		\$328.00 ²	
503 ²	Optional equipment - specify HYD PUMP & GRILL GUARD ²		\$454.00 ²	
103 ²	Optional equipment - specify HYD TRAP DOOR (REQUIRES ADD FUNCTION) ²		\$697.00 ²	
115 ²	Optional equipment - specify STD HYDRAULIC ACTUATOR (UP TO 23' BOOM) ²		\$5,599.00 ²	
116 ²	Optional equipment - specify HD HYDRAULIC ACTUATOR (LARGER THAN 23' BOOM) ²		\$6,671.00 ²	
161 ²	Optional equipment - specify FACTORY MOUNTING (INCLUDES OUTBOUND FREIGHT) ²		\$9,211.00 ²	
	Optional equipment - specify			
	Optional equipment - specify			
	Optional equipment - specify			
	Optional equipment - specify			
	Optional equipment - specify			
	Optional equipment - specify			
	Temporary tag			
	Transfer existing registration (must provide tag number)			
	New state tag (specify state, county, city, sheriff, etc.)			
	Maintenance Plan - specify			
	Maintenance Plan - specify			
	Extended warranty - 3rd year			
	Extended warranty - 3rd & 4th years			

VEHICLE:	5613 with Diamond Boom Mower			
DEALER:			Kelly Tractor Co.	Kelly Tractor Co.
ZONE:	Western	Northern	Central	Southern
BASE PRICE:	-- No bid --	-- No bid --	\$118,756.00	\$118,756.00

% Discount ¹ 15% Discount ²	Discount percentage off manufacturer's current published retail prices for non-specified options and any optional models bid. This discount ONLY APPLIES to a downgrade or an upgrade to the model listed in this specification. It does not apply to a completely different make or model. (The discount is applied to the manufacturer's current published retail prices.) <i>15% Discount on all Massey Ferguson tractors and factory installed options. 10% Discount on all Diamond Mower products.²</i>	1	2
--	--	---	---



ORDER
 QUOTE

Date: July 22, 2014
 Quote good for 60 days from above date.

DEALER	CUSTOMER	SHIP TO
Company: <u>Kelly Tractor</u>	Company: <u>Sun'n Lake of Sebring</u>	Company: <u>TBD</u>
Name: <u>Greg Bennett</u>	Name: <u>Greg Griffin</u>	Name: _____
Address 1: <u>9651 Kelly Tractor Dr.</u>	Address 1: <u>5306 Sun'n Lake Blvd</u>	Address 1: _____
Address 2: _____	Address 2: _____	Address 2: _____
City/State/Prov: <u>Fort Meyers, FL</u>	City/State/Prov: <u>Sebring, FL</u>	City/State/Prov: _____
Zip Code: <u>33905</u>	Zip Code: <u>33872</u>	Zip Code: _____
Phone: <u>305.592.5360</u>	Phone: <u>863.382.2988</u>	Phone: _____
Email: <u>greg_bennett@kellytractor.com</u>	Email: _____	Email: _____
Fax: _____	Fax: _____	Fax: _____
Mobile: <u>786.229.7037</u>	Mobile: _____	Mobile: _____
P.O. #: _____	P.O. #: _____	

QTY	ORDER CODE	DESCRIPTION	LIST	EXT. COST
1	DBM-C-M	19-Foot Side Fold Boom	\$ 24,045	\$ 24,045
1	102	Transport Lock	\$ 429	\$ 429
1	DBR050-H	50" Boom Rotary Head	\$ 10,874	\$ 10,874
1	160	Factory Mount - Side Fold Boom Mowers	\$ 4,657	\$ 4,657
			\$ -	\$ -
			\$ -	\$ -
			\$ -	\$ -
			\$ -	\$ -
			\$ -	\$ -
			\$ -	\$ -
		Total Before Freight	\$ 40,005	\$ 40,005
		Freight - pick up bare tractor, ship to factory and return completed unit to Sebring, FL		\$ 5,150
		TOTAL	\$ 40,005	\$ 45,155

TRACTOR	<input type="checkbox"/> 2WD	<input type="checkbox"/> 4WD	REAR AXLES	
Make, Model & Year: _____	Case 95		Rack & Pinion:	<input type="checkbox"/> Yes <input type="checkbox"/> No
Tractor Serial#: _____			EXHAUST STYLE	
Front Tire Size: _____			Corner Post:	<input type="checkbox"/> Yes <input type="checkbox"/> No
Rear Tire Size: _____			State Contract:	<input type="checkbox"/> Yes <input type="checkbox"/> No
Triple Link Suspension:	<input type="checkbox"/> Yes <input type="checkbox"/> No		State Contract Name: _____	
Suspended Cab:	<input type="checkbox"/> Yes <input type="checkbox"/> No		Dealer Compensation:	<input type="checkbox"/> Yes <input type="checkbox"/> No
Panoramic Window:	<input type="checkbox"/> Yes <input type="checkbox"/> No			

Special Instructions:

Desired Delivery Date: _____ Quoted Delivery Date: 7-9 weeks

Sales Rep: Tim Kubista
 Phone: (651) 955-6665
 Email: tkubista@diamondmowers.com

DIAMOND MOWERS, INC. DEMAND BRILLIANCE.
 27134 S. Parklane Drive / Sioux Falls, SD 57106
 605.368.5865 ph / 605.498.1222 fx / diamondmowers.com

DEMAND BRILLIANCE.



BOOM MOWERS

Extend, Expand, Exceed Your Reach.

Raise the boom, lower the boom, move the boom and adjust the boom. Diamond Boom Mowers are an effective, versatile solution for tricky environments like ditches, guardrails, fences, slopes and more. They are highly effective on smaller trees and heavy-duty brush. Diamond does booms right with a wide array of lengths and heads. *Experience Diamond.*

- Side-fold booms available in 19 ft., 21 ft. and 23 ft. lengths.
- Rear Cradle Booms available in standard duty sizes at 22 ft. and 23 ft.
- Rear Cradle Booms available in heavy-duty sizes at 23 ft., 25 ft., 28 ft. and 30 ft.



PROUD TO BE MADE IN THE USA

We are a company built from the ground up on American values and a Midwestern work ethic. Our first job is to provide you with the toughest, smartest, most reliable and safest equipment needed to do your job better.

Demand Value. Demand Diamond.

BOOM MOWERS



AVAILABLE MOWER HEADS

50" and 60" Rotary Mower Heads

- Cut up to 8" diameter brush and trees
- Diamond exclusive Reinforcing Ring
- Proprietary Tri-Hex mulching disc provides greater inertia in tough conditions. *Our Tri-Hex disc is covered by an unprecedented 5-year warranty.*

44" and 50" HD Flail Mower Heads and 63" STD Flail Head

- 44" and 50" HD cut up to 6" diameter grass/brush
- 63" STD cuts up to 2" diameter grass/brush
- Protective bonnet for safer operation
- Flail knives less likely to propel objects

48" Saw Head & Ditcher Attachment also available.



FLAIL



ROTARY

ROTARY VS. FLAIL: GOING HEAD-TO-HEAD

Well, it's not really a fight. Both our rotary and flail heads are top notch. The difference is the working environment, your needs and the ultimate goal.

The Rotary Mower is an overall faster cut for brush and some trees. It leaves a rougher cut than the flail's finer finish. And, the rotary does require some added safety precautions. Over the long haul it can cost you less to operate.

The Flail Mower offers a safer operating platform, while providing a much more manicured and clean cut. Its higher quality cut will require a slower tractor speed. In long-term costs it will generally run higher than the rotary mower.

TIER 4 TRACTOR MID-MOUNT AVAILABLE NOW

Tier 4 tractors are a sign of the times and represent a major design change. Diamond has led the way in meeting the challenge by re-engineering our booms to mid-mount on Tier 4 tractors. We are the first to do so in the industry and today we can mid-mount on Tier 4 New Holland, John Deere, Massey Ferguson, Case and Challenger tractors. Don't be caught without a solution and on a wait-list when the Tier 3 tractors are gone. Diamond has your answer – and we can deliver now.

BOOM OPTIONS AND UPGRADES

4-Function Proportional Control Joystick

- Improved ergonomics
- Increased mowing speed in tough terrain because of shorter operator reaction time
- Decreased operator fatigue

Hydraulic Actuator

- Longer life compared to traditional horizontal swing cylinder
- Fully enclosed
- Fewer moving parts and easy to maintain
- Stronger than traditional pivot pin
- Break-away protection in both forward & reverse
- 180° range of motion versus 110° with traditional swing cylinder

Dx2 Mainframe System upgrade available on Rear Cradle Booms accepts side attachments with boom in stow.

Transport Lock

Rear Cradle Extension

Pump & Grill Guard

Hydraulic Trap Doors available for 50" and 60" rotary and 50" flail heads.

ONE-YEAR WARRANTY ON PARTS AND LABOR.



DIAMOND MOWERS

27134 S. Parklane Drive | Sioux Falls, SD 57106

Phone: 800.658.5561 • Fax: 605.498.1222

diamondmowers.com • info@diamondmowers.com